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PRESS RELEASE

Biznet Hosts Biznet Festival Bali 2016

Denpasar, 23 July 2016 – Repeating the success of Biznet Festival Kediri 2016 that was held on 5 March 2016, this
month Biznet will host Biznet Festival event in Denpasar, Bali on 23 July 2016. Biznet Festival Bali 2016 will be held at
Lapangan Utama Renon, Denpasar, with various entertainment activities such as Band Competition, Dance
Competition, BMX Competition, Booth Festival and also performances from Indonesia’s well known bands including
Painful by Kisses, Shaggydog, and Endank Soekamti. Moreover, all visitors will be able to enjoy free Internet
connection throughout the event. The people in Bali is invited to come to Biznet Festival Bali 2016 for free by making
a registration through www.biznetfestival.com or by coming to Biznet branch office in Denpasar, Nusa Dua, Ubud,
Tabanan and Negara.

This event is one of Biznet’s efforts to introduce Biznet products and services to more people in Bali and surrounding
areas. Biznet Festival Bali 2016 will also be the best moment for the people in Bali, who are interested to find out
more about all services and products offered by Biznet according to customer requirements, either for personal, family
or business requirements.

Bali is one of the areas in Indonesia with the highest demand for Internet in Indonesia. As one of the most popular
destinations for many local and international tourists, Bali requires the best technology infrastructure which will
become the solution for the increasing demand for Internet connection, not only for the people in Bali but also for
millions of tourists who spend their holiday in Bali every year.

Biznet is doing expansion to Karangasem Regency (Amlapura City), Klungkung Regency (Semarapura City) and
Gianyar Regency (Gianyar City), hopefully it will be finished December 2016. For Buleleng Regency (Singaraja City)
is targeted by December 2017.

“We have the commitment to reduce the digital gap between Indonesia with other developing countries in the world,
by continue expanding our networks to more areas in Indonesia. Biznet Fiber has been installed in more than 16.000
KM throughout Indonesia. With the readiness of Biznet Fiber Java Bali network, we are hoping that the people in Bali
as well as tourists who come to Bali can experience the fastest Internet service with an affordable price,” said Adi
Kusma, President Director of Biznet Networks.

For Bali area, Biznet is providing services for both retail and business segment. Biznet also provides Biznet Hospitality
service that offers an integrated solution of Biznet Dedicated Internet and Biznet Cable TV service with an affordable
price and easy-to-manage operation system for hotels, dormitory, service apartments and also hospitals. Hospitality
business is getting more competitive these days, especially in tourism areas like Bali. Hotel customers are having
higher demands for the best service and complete facilities including high-speed Internet and complete Cable TV
channels.

----

About Biznet
Biznet is a company that focuses on telecommunication and multimedia business, with a commitment to build modern
infrastructure to reduce Indonesia’s digital gap with other developed countries. Biznet owns and operates the most
advance fiber optic network and data center in Indonesia. For more information about the company and services,
please visit www.biznetnetworks.com.

http://www.biznetnetworks.com


PT. Supra Primatama Nusantara (Biznet Networks)
MidPlaza 2, 8th Floor. Jl. Jend. Sudirman 10-11. Jakarta 10220 – Indonesia.
P +62-21-57998888 F +62-21-5700580 Call Biznet 1500988 www.biznetnetworks.com

For more information, please contact:
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